### **Purchasing Department**

### Madison County Board of Supervisors 146 West Center Street Canton, Mississippi 39046

601-855-5503 hardy@madison-co.com

15 August 2019

District 1 Supervisor Sheila Jones

District 2 Supervisor Trey Baxter

District 3 Supervisor Gerald Steen

District 4 Supervisor David Bishop

District 5 Supervisor Paul Griffin

Subject: Award Construction-Related Term Bids

### Dear Board Members:

Attached are copies of recently-opened construction-related term bids and an asphalt-related construction spreadsheet tabulation. I recommend that the Board take the following action:

- 1. Award the term bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 2 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ADCAMP at the price of \$83.35 per ton.
- 2. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 2 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to APAC at the price of \$91 per ton.
- 3. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 2 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ Construction at the price of \$94 per ton.
- 4. Award the term bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ADCAMP at the price of \$85.35 per ton.
- 5. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to APAC at the price of \$94 per ton.

- 6. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ Construction at the price of \$100 per ton.
- 7. Award the term bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING Hot Mix 9.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) to ADCAMP at the price of \$87.35 per ton.
- 8. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING Hot Mix 9.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to APAC at the price of \$97 per ton.
- 9. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING Hot Mix 9.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ Construction at the price of \$100 per ton.
- 10. Award the term bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING Hot Mix 12.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ADCAMP at the price of \$89.35 per ton.
- 11. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING Hot Mix 12.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to APAC at the price of \$94 per ton.
- 12. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING 12.5 MM ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ Construction at the price of \$95 per ton.
- 13. Award the term bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING BB1 BASE ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ADCAMP at the price of \$81.60 per ton.
- 14. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING BB1 BASE ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to APAC at the price of \$89.45 per ton.
- 15. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for FURNISHING, HAULING, AND LAYING BB1 BASE ASPHALT (turnkey price; contractor provides asphalt) for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ Construction at the price of \$90 per ton.
- 16. Award the Term Bid for COLD MILLING (contractor retains and disposes of milling residue) for the period 1 Oct 2017 30 September 15 to ADCAMP at the price of \$3 per Square Yard.

- 17. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MILLING (contractor retains and disposes of milling residue) for the period 1 Oct 2017 30 September 15 to AJ CONSTRUCTION at the price of \$3 per Square Yard.
- 18. Award the Second Alternate Term Bid for COLD MILLING (contractor retains and disposes of milling residue) for the period 1 Oct 2017 30 September 15 to APAC at the price of \$6.75 per Square Yard.
- 19. Award the Term Bid for COLD MILLING (county retains milling residue; contractor hauls milling residue to Road Dept) for the period 1 Oct 2017 30 September 15 to AJ CONSTRUCTION at the price of \$4.50 per Square Yard.
- 20. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for COLD MILLING (county retains milling residue; contractor hauls milling residue to Road Dept) for the period 1 Oct 2017 30 September 15 to ADCAMP at the price of \$5 per Square Yard.
- 21. Award the term bids for Road Base Repairs for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ACAMP at the prices of \$68 per square yard for up to 10-inch depth and \$150 per square yard for 11 to 24-inch depth.
- 22. Award the First Alternate term bids for Road Base Repairs for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to AJ CONSTRUCTION at the prices of \$115 per square yard for up to 10-inch depth and \$300 per square yard for 11to 24-inch depth.
- 23. Award the term bids for Road Reclamation for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 September 2019 to ACAMP at the prices of \$50 for four-inch depth; \$60 for eight-inch depth; \$70 for 12-inch depth; \$80 for 18-inch depth; and \$90 for 24-inch depth.
- 24. Award the Term Bid for MUD-JACKING for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 Sept 2019 to Ewing & Ray Foundation Services.
- 25. Award the First Alternate Term Bid for MUD-JACKING for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 Sept 2019 to Murray Mud-Jacking Services, Inc.
- 26. Award the Term Bid for CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 Sept 2019 to Bulldog Construction Company.
- 27. Award the Term Bid for POLYURETHANE FOAM APPLICATIONS for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 Sept 2019 to Bulldog Construction Company.
- 28. Award the Term Bid for POLYURETHANE FOAM APPLICATIONS for the period 1 Oct 2018 30 Sept 2019 to Ewing & Ray Foundation Services.

29. Award the Term Bid for BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION for the period 1 Oct 2018 – 30 Sept 2019 to Key LLC.

Thank you in advance for your consideration of the above recommendations.

Sincerely.

Purchase Clerk

Attachments: Copies of bids

Asphalt bids tabulation

# ASPHALT-RELATED CONSTRUCTION TABULATION FOR TERM BID PERIOD 1 OCT 2018 TO 30 SEPT 2019

		2ND ALTERNATE TERM BID	FIRST ALTERNATE TERM BID	PRIMARY TERM BID
adcampinc.com	ralph@	C: 940-1343	0: 939-4493	Ralph Barnes
apac.com	john.may@	F: 376-4055	O: 376-4000	Terry May
ajc-ms.com	john@ dongleen@	C: 601-667-3667	O: 601-667-3667 O: 346-7368	John Harreld
bellsouth.net	dongleen@	F: 346-7152	O: 346-7368	Don Gleen

## FURNISHING, HAULING, & LAYING ASPHALT TURNKEY PRICE; CONTRACTOR PROVIDES ASPHALT

907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 12.5 MM MIXTURE BB1 BASE ASPHALT	907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 9.5 MM MIXTURE	SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT	SC 1 TYPE II ASPHALT
---	---	---------------------	----------------------

\$81.60	\$89.35	\$87,35	\$85,35	\$83.35	Rankin	
\$89.45	\$94.00	\$97.00	\$94.00	\$91.00	Canton	
\$90.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	\$100.00	\$94.00	Canton	
\$102.00	\$105.00	\$105.00	\$102.00	\$102.00	Jackson	7.
	\$89.45 \$90.00	\$5 \$94.00 \$95.00 \$0 \$89.45 \$90.00	35       \$97.00       \$100.00         35       \$94.00       \$95.00         60       \$89.45       \$90.00	35       \$94.00       \$100.00         35       \$97.00       \$100.00         35       \$94.00       \$95.00         60       \$89.45       \$90.00	35       \$91.00       \$94.00         35       \$94.00       \$100.00         35       \$97.00       \$100.00         35       \$94.00       \$95.00         80       \$89.45       \$90.00	Canton Canton Ja.  Canton Canton Ja.  \$91.00 \$94.00  \$5 \$94.00 \$100.00  \$5 \$97.00 \$100.00  \$5 \$94.00 \$95.00  \$89.45 \$90.00

### COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD

CONTRACTOR ASSUME OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE AND DISPOSES OF SAME

\$3.00	Rankin	ADCAMP
\$6.75	Canton	APAC
\$3.00	Canton	AJ CONST

1,500 SQ YDS per day minimum

### COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) PER SQ YD

COUNTY RETAINS OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE CONTRACTOR HAULS SAME TO ROAD DEPARTMENT

00	kin	AMP
\$4	Can	AJ CC
50	fon	SNC

ADC, Ran

### ROAD BASE REPAIRS (10 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD

ROAD BASE REPAIRS (11-24 INCH DEPTH) PER SQ YD

\$150	\$68.00	ADCAMP Rankin
\$300.00	\$115.00	AJ CONST Canton

### ROAD RECLAMATION

4 Inches 8 Inches 12 Inches 18 Inches 24 Inches

### ROAD PAVING (FURNISH, TRANSPORT, AND LAY-DOWN ASPHALT)

The road paving term bid shall be a <u>turn-key</u> price that includes furnishing, transporting, and laying-down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's choosing.

SC 1 TYPE II ASPHALT	\$ 83.35	per ton
SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT	\$ 85.35	per ton
BB 1 BASE ASPHALT	\$ 81.60	per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 9.5 MM MIX	TURE \$ 87.35	per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 12.5 MM MI	XTURE	
	\$ 89.35	per ton

COL	D MILL	ING (AI	L DEPT	HS)			
CON	TRACT	OR ASS	UMES O	WNERSI	HIP OF	MILLING	RESIDUE
AND	SHALL	BE RES	PONSIB	LE FOR	LOADI	NG, TRAN	SPORTING
AND	DISPOS	SING OF	SAID M	ILLING	RESIDI	UE.	

	\$ 3.00	PER SQUARE YARD
COLD MILLING (ALL DE COUNTY RETAINS OWN CONTRACTOR SHALL BI TRANSPORTING, AND DI TO THE MADISON COUT 3137 SOUTH LIBERTY ST	ERSHIP OF MI E RESPONSIBI ELIVERING SA Y ROAD DEPA	LE FOR LOADING, AID MILLING RESIDUE ARTMENT LOCATED AT
	\$ 5.00	PER SQUARE YARD
ROAD BASE REPAIRS		
Dig out road to depth of 10 in	ches and replace	with base asphalt
	\$68.00	PER SQUARE YARD
Dig out road to depth of 11 -2	4 inches and rep	lace with base asphalt
	\$150.00	PER SQUARE YARD
ROAD RECLAMATION (F	Pay Item will be	Per Square Yard)
4 (four) inch depth	\$50.00	PER SQUARE YARD
8 (eight) inch depth	\$60.00	PER SQUARE YARD
12 (twelve) inch depth	\$70.00	PER SQUARE YARD
18 (eighteen) inch depth	\$80.00	PER SQUARE YARD

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:_	ADCAMP, INC.	
ADDRESS:	P. O. BOX 54246	
	JACKSON, MS 39288-4246	
TELEPHONE:	601-939-4493	
CELL PHONE NUMB	SER:601-940-1343	
FAX NUMBER:	601-939-4676	
EMAIL:	ralph@adcampinc.com	
AUTHORIZED REPR	ÈSENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	AUGUST 14, 2018 DATE
RALPH BARNES, PRE	SIDENT	
PRINTED AUTHORIZ	ZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAMI	E HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### ROAD PAVING (FURNISH, TRANSPORT, AND LAY-DOWN ASPHALT)

The road paving term bid shall be a <u>turn-key</u> price that includes furnishing, transporting, and laying-down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's choosing.

SC 1 TYPE II ASPHALT	9100 per ton
SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT	\$ 9400 per ton
BB 1 BASE ASPHALT	#8945 per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 9.5 M	M MIXTURE  # 97 00 per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 12.5 N	MM MIXTURE  \$\overline{400}\$ per ton
All prices listed above require a	
	Tayllay

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) CONTRACTOR ASSUMES OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE AND SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOADING, TRANSPORTING, AND DISPOSING OF SAID MILLING RESIDUE. lold milling requires a min.m. of 1500 sq. yos pu day. COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS) COUNTY RETAINS OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE. CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOADING, TRANSPORTING, AND DELIVERING SAID MILLING RESIDUE TO THE MADISON COUTY ROAD DEPARTMENT LOCATED AT 3137 SOUTH LIBERTY STREET, CANTON, MS. PER SQUARE YARD ROAD BASE REPAIRS Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt PER SQUARE YARD

minimum of 100 50 yoks. Two Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt minimum of 100 sq. yds. Tw ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be Per Square Yard) PER SQUARE YARD 4 (four) inch depth PER SQUARE YARD 8 (eight) inch depth PER SQUARE YARD 12 (twelve) inch depth

18 (eighteen) inch depth

24 (twenty-four) inch depth

PER SQUARE YARD

PER SQUARE YARD

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: APAC-Wississippi, Inc.	N
ADDRESS: 1.0. Box 24508	5
Jackson, Uls 3925-4508	(A)
TELEPHONE: 601-376-4000	
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-951-8766	96
FAX NUMBER: 601-376-4055	
EMAIL: john. May @ apac. Com	
( Punty	8-13-18
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME I	HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### ROAD PAVING (FURNISH, TRANSPORT, AND LAY-DOWN ASPHALT)

The road paving term bid shall be a <u>turn-key</u> price that includes furnishing, transporting, and laying-down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's choosing.

SC 1 TYPE II ASPHALT	\$ 94.00	_ per ton
SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT	\$ 100.00	_ per ton
BB 1 BASE ASPHALT	\$ 90.00	_ per ton
007 400 A VVOTIA (VV. A CRVVA A TOTA (A D. O. A.)		
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 9.5 MM M	IIXTURE	
	\$ 100.00	_ per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 12.5 MM l	MIXTURE	
	\$ 95.00	_ per ton

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)
CONTRACTOR ASSUMES OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE
AND SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOADING, TRANSPORTING
AND DISPOSING OF SAID MILLING RESIDUE.

# 3.00 PER SQUARE YARD **COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)** COUNTY RETAINS OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE. CONTRACTOR SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOADING, TRANSPORTING, AND DELIVERING SAID MILLING RESIDUE TO THE MADISON COUTY ROAD DEPARTMENT LOCATED AT 3137 SOUTH LIBERTY STREET, CANTON, MS. # 4. 50 PER SQUARE YARD ROAD BASE REPAIRS Dig out road to depth of 10 inches and replace with base asphalt #//5.00 PER SQUARE YARD Dig out road to depth of 11 -24 inches and replace with base asphalt # 300.00 PER SQUARE YARD

### ROAD RECLAMATION (Pay Item will be Per Square Yard)

4 (four) inch depth		PER SQUARE YARD
8 (eight) inch depth	-	PER SQUARE YARD
12 (twelve) inch depth	-	PER SQUARE YARD
18 (eighteen) inch depth	Seeming	PER SQUARE YARD
24 (twenty-four) inch depth	7	PER SQUARE YARD

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: AJ Construction Irc.
ADDRESS: Milling: PO Box 2024 Median, MS 39130
Physical: 3093 South Library St. Contag 15 39046
TELEPHONE: 60/ - 667 - 3667
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-540-5731
FAX NUMBER: 601- 667- 3667
EMAIL: john @ ajc-ms.com
AUTHORIZED REPRESENȚATIVE'S SIGNATURE  8/14/18 DATE
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
John C Harreld Jr.
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### ROAD PAVING (FURNISH, TRANSPORT, AND LAY-DOWN ASPHALT)

The road paving term bid shall be a <u>turn-key</u>price that includes furnishing, transporting, and laying-down the asphalt. The asphalt may come from any plant of the contractor's choosing.

SC 1 TYPE II ASPHALT	8/0200	_per ton
SC 1 TYPE 8 ASPHALT	\$/02.00	per ton
Y.		
BB 1 BASE ASPHALT	\$102.00	per ton
* · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 9.5 MM MIX	TURE	
	\$10500	per ton
907-403-A HOT MIX ASPHALT ST 12.5 MM MIX	XTURE	
		per ton

COLD MILLING (ALL DEPTHS)	
CONTRACTOR ASSUMES OWNERSHIP OF MILLING RESIDUE	
AND SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOADING, TRANSPORTING,	
AND DISPOSING OF SAID MILLING RESIDUE.	

	No BES	PER SQUARE YARD
COLD MILLING (ALL DEP COUNTY RETAINS OWNER CONTRACTOR SHALL BE TRANSPORTING, AND DEI TO THE MADISON COUTY B137 SOUTH LIBERTY STR	RSHIP OF MILL RESPONSIBLE LIVERING SAID ROAD DEPAR	FOR LOADING, MILLING RESIDUE FMENT LOCATED AT
	No Bid	PER SQUARE YARD
Property of the control of the contr	nes and replace wi	th base asphalt
	No Brd	PER SQUARE YARD
Dig out road to depth of 11 -24	inches and replace	e with base asphalt
	No Bid	PER SQUARE YARD
ROAD RECLAMATION (Pag	y Item will be Pe	rSquare Yard)
4 (four) inch depth	No Bid	_PER SQUARE YARD
8 (eight) inch depth	No Bid	_PER SQUARE YARD
12 (twelve) inch depth	NoBid	_PER SQUARE YARD
18 (eighteen) inch depth	No Bid	_PER SQUARE YARD

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bidby the Madison County Board of Supervisors for any or all of the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Dickerson & Bowen Inc.	
ADDRESS: P.O. Box 1008	
Brookh Aven, Ms. 39602	
TELEPHONE: (601) 969-2002	
CELL PHONE NUMBER: (601) \$40-5005	8
FAX NUMBER: (601) 969-2004	
EMAIL: double one bell south. Net	
	8/14/18
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE	DATE
Don Glaw Confract Admin 13 hools	Impr
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME	HEKE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### **MUD-JACKING**

Mudjacking Services to consist of pressure grouting of underground voids near pipes, roads, bridges, foundations, etc., with soil cement consisting of water, type 1 Portland cement, and non-organic fine grade red sand. Services shall include the ability to smoke test for voids prior to and after pressure grouting operations. Company shall be required to notify Madison County Road Department of when it will begin a job and when said job is complete. Madison County Road Department must be notified of time of smoke tests so that a Road Department representative can witness said test.

ITEM	Cost
Per Hour	\$ 200
Minimum number of hours	8 HR MIN.
Cement	\$ 15° per 94 # BAG
Sand	$\frac{15^{2}}{9}$ pre cubic yard
1 & ½ inch SCH PVC Pipe	\$
Fittings	\$each as needed
Holes drilled	\$each as needed
Smoke Testing	\$
Mobilization	\$ N/A

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term

bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: EWING & KAY FOUNDATION SERVICES, INC
ADDRESS: 116 BUSINESS PARK DRIVE
RIDGELAND MS 39157
TELEPHONE: 601-856-3700
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-594-3708
FAX NUMBER: 601-853-0275
EMAIL: Cray @ ewisgandray. Com
6/14/18
AUTHORIZED RÉPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
DEDICED ALITHODIZED DEDDESENTATIVE'S NAME HEDE
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE  OREY  DEPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### **MUD-JACKING**

Mudjacking Services to consist of pressure grouting of underground voids near pipes, roads, bridges, foundations, etc., with soil cement consisting of water, type 1 Portland cement, and non-organic fine grade red sand. Services shall include the ability to smoke test for voids prior to and after pressure grouting operations. Company shall be required to notify Madison County Road Department of when it will begin a job and when said job is complete. Madison County Road Department must be notified of time of smoke tests so that a Road Department representative can witness said test.

ITEM	Cost
Per Hour	\$ 200.00
Minimum number of hours	8 hours
Cement	\$ 15.00 per 90 LB Bay
Sand	\$_15. pre cubic yard
1 & ½ inch SCH PVC Pipe	\$ _ 2.00 per foot
Fittings	\$_2. each as needed
Holes drilled	\$ 9 each as needed
Smoke Testing	\$ 100, per test entile on site
Mobilization	\$ included in 8 hours.

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term

bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: Murray Mul-facking her. Inc.
ADDRESS: PO BOX 656
Madison, MS 39130
TELEPHONE: 60/859-0500
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601 238 6650
FAX NUMBER: 601-859-0506
EMAIL:
Dalto Stract 8-14-18
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### **CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR:**

Six Inch Concrete Repair w/o steel reinforcement

140. °° per sy

Six Inch Concrete Repair with steel reinforcement

150. 00 per sy

**FINISHED CONCRETE WORK** (Includes concrete, labor, materials, tools, and equipment to form and finish concrete job of various sizes):

Price per cubic yard of concrete used:

CURB AND GUTTER WORK (Concrete shall be ready mix as per ASTM C-94, which will develop a minimum compressive strength of 3,000 psi at 28 days conforming to ASTM c-31. All reinforcing steel shall conform to ASTM A-15, grade 60)

Prices per linear foot:

<500 LF

500-2,000 LF

Greater 2,000 LF

24 inches

\$ 24.00

\$ 22.

\$ 20.

30 inches

\$ 26-

\$ 24-

\$ 22. "

Extruded Curb Only (only existing surface) \$ 8.50

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees

that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME:	Bulldog Con	15 truction	Company	Inc.
ADDRESS: <i>P. o.</i>	Box 1936			
Mas.	sm MS	39110		
TELEPHONE: (60 L	)853-4242	FAX: (601	)853-4	1202
EMAIL: ERice	e Bulldog Con	struction	Company	, Com
SIGNATURE:	Esle_	_ I	DATE: 8	/8/18

### CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR:

Six Inch Concrete Repair w/o steel reinforcement

<u>1550</u> per sy

Six Inch Concrete Repair with steel reinforcement

2550 per sy

FINISHED CONCRETE WORK (Includes concrete, labor, materials, tools, and equipment to form and finish concrete job of various sizes):

Price per cubic yard of concrete used:

1-3 cy <u>1,500</u> 4-5 cy <u>1000</u> 6-9 cy <u>1000</u> 9+cy <u>1000</u>

CURB AND GUTTER WORK (Concrete shall be ready mix as per ASTM C-94, which will develop a minimum compressive strength of 3,000 psi at 28 days conforming to ASTM c-31. All reinforcing steel shall conform to ASTM A-15, grade 60)

Prices per linear foot:

<500 LF

500-2,000 LF

Greater 2,000 LF

24 inches

\$ 25

\$ 26

\$ 22.50

30 inches

\$ 30

\$ 30

\$ 27.50

Extruded Curb Only (only existing surface) \$ 25 per LF

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a

product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees

that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: ABG Contractors, INC
ADDRESS: 115 Riley Drive
ADDRESS: 115 Riley Drive  Jackson, MS 39209
TELEPHONE: 601-923-4200 FAX: 601-923-2771
EMAIL: melanie @ abg contractorsinc
SIGNATURE: Melanie Gleen DATE: 8-13-18

Home Page Creator H	lit Statistics	Agenda Builde	r Plannin	g and Zoning Archives	Election Commission Archiv	es Planning and	Zoning	Logou
MHdUTool Email Manager View Pending Bids View Open Bids View Closed Bids	200741	d Tool w 10 ✓ entries				Search:		
View Public Log	no ID	Name	Phone	Email	Company Name	Date Submitted	Bid Amount	View Bid
Current Time: 08-14-2018 10:24: am	14	Source Management	(206) 373- 9500	sourcemanagement2@or	nvia.com Onvia	07-31-2018 06:57:11 pm	\$	
	19	Melanie Green	(601) 923- 4200	Melanie@abgcontractors	inc.com ABG Contractors	, 08-13-2018 04:50:59 pm	\$	<u>View</u> Bid

Showing 1 to 2 of 2 entries Previous 1 Next

Switch to Advanced View

### POLYURETHANE FOAM APPLICATIONS

All void filling, undersealing, and lifting and leveling sidewalks and curb and gutter shall conform to MDOT Special Provision 907-420.

	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	<100	lbs	410.00
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	100-500	lbs	8,50
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	>500	lbs	8,50
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	<100	lbs	(0,00
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	100-500	lbs	8.50
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	>500	lbs	8.50
Void Filling and Undersealing	<100	1bs	10,00
Void Filling and Undersealing	100-500	lbs	<u> </u>
Void Filling and Undersealing	>500	1bs	Q, 50

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is

listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: BULLDOG CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
ADDRESS: P.O. BOX 1936
MADISON MS 39130
TELEPHONE: 601-853-4242
CELL PHONE NUMBER: 601-624-8139
FAX NUMBER: 601-853-4202
EMAIL: TREY @ BULDOG CONSTRUCTION COMPANY. Com
B a Ell Ut 8/13/18
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
PREY JUKSON  PREY ALTERIORIZED DEDDESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

PRINTED AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S NAME HERE

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### POLYURETHANE FOAM APPLICATIONS

All void filling, undersealing, and lifting and leveling sidewalks and curb and gutter shall conform to MDOT Special Provision 907-420.

	Quantity	Unit	Unit Price
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	<100	lbs	1200
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	100-500	lbs	1000
Concrete Sidewalk Leveling and Lifting	>500	lbs	900
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	<100	lbs	1200
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	100-500	lbs	10 0
Concrete Curb & Gutter Leveling & Lifting	>500	lbs	900
Void Filling and Undersealing	<100	lbs	1200
Void Filling and Undersealing	100-500	lbs	100
Void Filling and Undersealing	>500	lbs	900

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is

listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: FLUING ERAY FOUNDATION SERVICES, INC.
ADDRESS: 116 BUSINESS PARK DRIVE
RIDGELAND, MS 39157
TELEPHONE: 601-856-3700
CELL PHONE NUMBER: <u>601-594-3708</u>
FAX NUMBER: 601-853-0275
EMAIL: Cray@ewingandray, Con
08/14/18
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE'S SIGNATURE DATE
COREY L. RAY
DDD FEED AT FELLOD FOED DEDDE GENERATIVE FOR ALLANCE FEED E

NOTE: ALL BID SHEETS MUST BE SIGNED AND DATED BY AN AUTHORIZED COMPANY REPRESENTATIVE

### MADISON COUNTY BOARD OF SUPERVISORS BRIDGE CONSTRUCTION

### TERM BIDS FOR PERIOD 1 OCT 2018 - 30 SEPT 2019

### SPECIFICATIONS AND BID SHEET

### BIDS DUE 10 A.M. 14 AUGUST 2018

### ALL BIDS MUST BE SIGNED AND SUBMITTED ON THE COUNTY-FURNISHED BID SHEET.

### BIDS MAY BE SUBMITTED BY EITHER OF THE FOLLOWING TWO METHODS:

- 1. Sealed bids will be received until 10 a.m. on August 14, 2018, at the Madison County Chancery Clerk's Office, Rooms 225-228, 125 West North Street, Canton, MS 39046. All sealed bids submitted to the Chancery Clerk's office shall have the bidder's name and "Bridge Construction Bid" written on the outside face of the envelope. If any envelope is not so marked, said bid shall not be opened and considered.
- 2. Electronic bids will be received until 10 a.m. on August 14, 2018, as a PDF file via Madison County's website at <a href="http://www.madison-co.com/bids">http://www.madison-co.com/bids</a>. Each bidder submitting a bid electronically shall include a signed copy of Madison County's bid sheet as part of its PDF bid submittal.

All work will be preformed in accordance with Mississippi Department of Transportation State Aid Road and Bridge Specifications.

### COUNTRACTOR TO FURNISH ALL NEEDED MATERIALS UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED:

Creosote bridge l	umber in place for sum of $\frac{4}{2}$ , 155 per MBM.
Driving treated ti	mber pilings for sum of <u>* 25 -</u> per foot.
Pouring encaseme	ents around steel pilings for sum of \$\frac{\frac{4}{565}}{1565}\$ per cubic yard.
and caps:	crete spans, including guardrails, filler blocks, grouting joints, posts, butment spans for sum of per square foot
Int	termediate spans for the sum of <u>9.90</u> per square foot.
and caps:	crete spans, including guardrails, filler blocks, grouting joints, posts, butment spans for sum of $\frac{\cancel{+}8.15}{\cancel{-}90}$ per square foot.
Remove, reset, ar sum of <sup>\$</sup> /6.5	nd regrout one 19-foot precast bridge span including guardrails for the per square foot.
Remove, reset, ar sum of 49.76	nd regrout one 31-foot precast bridge span including guardrails for the per square foot.
Furnish and insta 63- per foot	ll "H" beam (10x42) steel pilings for bridges in place for the sum of
Furnish concrete	pilings (14x14) in place for the sum of <u>\$57.90</u> per foot.
Setting and grout	ing caps for concrete pilings for sum ofeach.
Furnish and drive	e test pilings for sum of $\frac{7}{7,550}$ – each.
	ctural steel in place for the sum of
Furnish rip-rap ir	place for the sum of 81.15 per ton.
Mobilization per	job site <u>6,250 -</u> .
Miscellaneous cle	earing and grubbing for the sum of 4/40- per acre.

Remove, reset, and regrout 19-foot abutment cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each 43,450 -

Remove, reset, and regrout 31-foot abutment cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each #3, 955 -

Remove, reset, and regrout 19-foot intermediate Cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each \$3,450 -

Remove, reset, and regrout 31-foot intermediate cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each 3,955 -

Remove 19-foot abutment cap

Each \$ 855 -

Remove 19-foot abutment cap from job site

Remove 31-foot abutment cap

Each \*1,225 -

Remove 31-foot abutment cap from job site

Each \$ 230 -

Remove 19-foot intermediate cap

Each \$845 -

Remove 19-foot intermediate cap from job site

Each + 195-

Remove 31-foot intermediate cap

Each 1225-

Remove 31-foot intermediate cap from job site

Each \$ 230 -

Set and grout one 19-foot abutment cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each \_ 6,015 -

Set and grout 31-foot abutment cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each 6, 250 =

Set and grout 19-foot intermediate Cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each 6,015-

Set and grout 31-foot intermediate Cap (includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Each 6, 250 -

Set and grout one 19-foot abutment cap (County furnished, includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).

Set and grout 31-foot abutment cap (County furnished,

includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).	Each \$2,950 -
Set and grout 19-foot intermediate cap (County furnished, includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).	Each <u>*2,550</u> —
Set and grout 31-foot intermediate cap (County furnished, includes replacing neoprene bearing pads).	Each = 2,950 -
Remove 19-foot precast bridge span including guard	Per Square Foot \$\frac{\psi}{3.95}\$  Per Square Foot \$\frac{\psi}{2.90}\$
Remove 19-foot precast bridge span from job site	Per Square Foot \$\frac{\pm 2.90}{}
Remove 31-foot precast bridge span (including guardrails)	Per Square Foot \$ .05
Remove 31-foot precast bridge span (metading guardrans)  Remove 31-foot precast bridge span from job site	Per Square Foot \$2.30
Remove 31-100t precast orage span from job site	Tel Square Foot
Colored a word 10 foot was east builder and	
Set and grout 19-foot precast bridge span (including guardrails) County Furnished	Per Square Foot 15.05
Set, and grout 31-foot precast bridge span (including guardrails) County Furnished	Per Square Foot £.15
Splice Existing Timber Piling (6' of Grout-Filled	Each_ \$ 2,895 -
30" CMP)	Each #1300—
	Each #1300— Each #155—
30" CMP)  Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling	Each //300 — Each */55 —  Per Square Foot *7/.75
30" CMP)  Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling	Each #1300— Each #155—
So" CMP)  Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling  Furnish and drive concrete sheet piling	Each //300 — Each */55 —  Per Square Foot *7/.75
30" CMP)  Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling  Furnish and drive concrete sheet piling  Furnish and install Type V Geotextile fabric and Appurtenances  Furnish and install grouted riprap (includes Type V Geotextile fabric and appurtenances).	Each $\frac{1}{300}$ — Each $\frac{1}{500}$ — Each $\frac{1}{500}$ — Per Square Foot $\frac{7}{7.75}$ Per Square Foot $\frac{7}{705}$ —  er Square Yard $\frac{5}{4.90}$ er Square Yard $\frac{5}{81.15}$
Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling  Furnish and drive concrete sheet piling  Furnish and install Type V Geotextile fabric and Appurtenances  Furnish and install grouted riprap (includes Type V Geotextile fabric and appurtenances).  Excavation work (remove, haul & dispose of dirt etc.)	Each //300 — Each */55 —  Per Square Foot *7/.75  Per Square Foot *705 —  er Square Yard *4.90  er Square Yard *8/./5  r Cubic Yard //7.35
Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling  Furnish and drive concrete sheet piling  Furnish and install Type V Geotextile fabric and Appurtenances  Furnish and install grouted riprap (includes Type V Geotextile fabric and appurtenances).  Excavation work (remove, haul & dispose of dirt etc.)	Each $\frac{1}{300}$ — Each $\frac{1}{500}$ — Each $\frac{1}{500}$ — Per Square Foot $\frac{7}{7.75}$ Per Square Foot $\frac{7}{705}$ —  er Square Yard $\frac{5}{4.90}$ er Square Yard $\frac{5}{81.15}$
Extract and remove piles Remove piles from job site  Furnish and drive steel sheet piling  Furnish and drive concrete sheet piling  Furnish and install Type V Geotextile fabric and Appurtenances  Furnish and install grouted riprap (includes Type V Geotextile fabric and appurtenances).  Excavation work (remove, haul & dispose of dirt etc.)  Removal of asphalt pavement from bridge deck	Each //300 — Each */55 —  Per Square Foot *7/.75  Per Square Foot *705 —  er Square Yard *4.90  er Square Yard *8/./5  r Cubic Yard //7.35

Install borrow material (LVM) Contractor Furnished	d Per Cubic Yard \$\frac{\sqrt{20.85}}{20.85}
Furnish and install six-foot-long by three-foot-high by three-foot-wide gabions (includes filter fabric, w crushed 100 lb. riprap filler, and grout).	ire mesh, Per Cubic Yard 675 - Per Linear Foot 95 -
Install Concrete Barrier	Per Linear Foot \$95-
Furnish and install concrete abutment wings	Per Each \$ 1,400 -
Install concrete abutment wings	Per Each \$845-
Furnish and install concrete headwalls, 6" thick Clawith #4 rebar 12" OC	Per Square Foot \$\frac{\frac{1}{25}}{25}
Mobilization per job site with crane Note: A jobsite may include multiple locations if al	Each $\frac{$30 - $115 - }{$100}$ Each other.
Mobilization per job site <u>without crane</u> Note: A jobsite may include multiple locations if al	Each 7500 –  l are within 1,000 feet of each other.
Remove cast in place concrete bridge deck and string	ngers Per Square Foot <u>B.15</u>
Remove cast in place concrete bridge deck and strin from site	Per Square Foot \$\frac{\psi}{2.65-}\$
Remove timber bridge deck and stringers	Per Square Foot 4.15 -
Remove timber deck and stringers from site	Per Square Foot 4.75-
Remove timber abutment and wing walls	Per Each
Remove timber abutment and wing walls from site	Per Each \$230 -
Remove timber caps	Per Each 635-
Remove timber caps from site	Per Each
Class B Structural Concrete (minor structures)	Per \$4 Yd #3,000 —

All work shall be preformed in accordance with Mississippi Department of Transportation State Aid Road and Bridge Specifications.

All materials unless specified otherwise, including deck grouting, required in the above construction pay items shall be an absorbed cost by the contractor.

The below signed company agrees that if it is awarded a Term Bid by the Madison County Board of Supervisors for the construction services on this Bid Sheet that it will provide said construction service(s) in a timely manner at the awarded term bid price for the duration of said term bid period. The below signed company further agrees that it will not provide quantities of a product and/or service in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order for each specific order. Furthermore, the below signed company agrees that if it does provide service(s) in an amount greater than is listed on the purchase order that it will hold Madison County responsible for the quantity of such service(s) that exceeds the purchase order amount.

COMPANY NAME: KEY, LLC
ADDRESS: <u>PD. Bx</u> 590
MADISON, MS 39130
TELEPHONE: 601-898-9892
FAX NUMBER: 60/-898-9096
EMAIL: PMCPHAIL & REYGLE LON
SIGNATURE: DATE: OB/14/18